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RECENT GERMAN-CANADIANA 

Although German-American Studies include the study 
of the history, literature and culture of the Gerrrian element 
in north and south America, its various branches in the 
western hemisphere have developed separately and inde-
pendently of one another. To the south, for example, there 
have been several quality publications, such as the 
Staden-Jahrbuch, an indispensable source for German-Bra-
zilian studies. Of immediate interest and importance to re-
searchers and students in the U.S. is the research and publi-
cation work carried on to the north in Canada. 

Since 1973 Hartmut Froeschle has edited Deutsch-
kanadisches Jahrbuch, a publication of the Historical Society 
of Mecklenburg Upper Canada, Inc., which deals with all 
aspects of the German-Canadian experience. Froeschle's 
essay ''Deutschkanadische Studien. Aufgaben und Moglich-
keiten'' presents a report on the status of German-Canadian 
studies and a historical survey of the development of the 
field.I He notes that "German Canadians constitute the third 
largest ethnic group and the third oldest European 
nationality in Canada.'' The volumes of the Jahrbuch which 
have appeared thus far are substantial and of the highest 
quality. The editor states in the preface to Volume 4, 1978 
that "research in the field of German-Canadian Studies has 
recently grown so considerably that the contents of this 
fourth volume of our Yearbook covers more than 360 pages 
instead of the 300 pages originally planned." 

A review of the first four volumes of the Jahrbuch 
offers insight into the status of German-Canadian studies as 
well as an introduction to its foremost researchers. Contri-
butors are laying solid foundations in their field. Georg 
Weissenborn provides an introductory overview of German-
Canadian history through his essay "The Germans in 
Canada. A Chronological Survey.'' 2 And a significant 
feature of the annual is Froeschle's "Deutschkanadische 
Bibliographie. '' Articles identify areas in need of research, 
such as Hermann Boeschenstein's "Das Studium der 
deutschkanadischen Presse - ein fruchtbares Arbeitsfeld.' '~ · 
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Froeschle's review essays on German-American studies, 
German-Canadian studies and German-American studies in 
Latin America are excellent surveys of recent publications, 
and they also indicate the diversity and the high quality of 
research being conducted in North and South America.4 

Supplementing the Jahrbuch is another publication of 
the Historical Society of Mecklenburg Upper Canada Inc., 
the Annalen Deutschkanadischer Studien, the first volume of 
which appeared in 1976 and the second in 1978. The distinct 
purpose of the Annalen is to publish a selection of papers 
presented at German-Canadian historical conferences. As 
such it complements and supplements the Jahrburch. In his 
essay on German-Canadian authors Froeschle notes that '' In 
einer Zeit, in der die einzelnen Volksgruppen N ordamerikas 
eine ungeahnte Renaissance erleben und die ethnischen 
Studien als akademische multidisziplinare Forschungsrich-
tung standig an Bedeutung gewinnen, wachst auch die Ein-
sicht in die Notwendigkeit, endlich das verschiittete kulturelle 
Erbe der Deutschkanadier wieder zu heben.' ' 5 Also note-
worthy are Karin Giirttler' s essay on the image of Canada in 
German travel literature of the 18th century, Herfried 
Scheer's essay on the dialect of the Hutterischen Bruder, and 
Hermann Boeschenstein's "Betrachtungen zur deutsch-
kanadischen Literatur.' '6 The second volume of the Annalen 
also contains original prose and poetry of German-Canadian 
authors. 

The field of German-Canadian studies is further 
enhanced by a new series, Deutschkanadische Schriften, 
published by the German Canadian Historical Association, 
edited by Hartmut Froeschle. The first volume in the series is 
Gottlieb Leibbrandt's Little Paradise. Aus Geschichte und 
Leben der Deutschkanadier in der County Waterloo, On-
tario, 1800-1975.7 Especially good is the chapter on German-
Canadian literature and its examples of German-Canadian 
poetry by authors, such as Gerhard Friesen. This series can 
serve to publish monographs dealing with the German 
element in specific locations in Canada, and should thereby 
contribute to German-Canadian studies considerably. 
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Information regarding the various projects of publica-
tions are found in the newsletter Canadiana Germanica. 
Although still in its early stages the field of German-Ca-
nadian studies can be said to have been already placed on 
solid foundations, and ones that are worthy of support and 
emulation by all those involved in German-American 
Studies. DON HEINRICH TOLZMAN 
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