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ABSTRACT
Grassroots hospitals, like other medical service institutions, are public welfare undertakings 
that the government provides services to the people. Because of its close to home, quick 
medical treatment, and good effect, grassroots hospitals have an important role in the treat-
ment of small diseases. However, this feature also brings the drawbacks of heavy tasks, low 
pay, and low status for medical workers, which directly lead to difficulties in the introduction 
of outstanding talents and the loss of current workers. Given this situation, this paper dis-
cusses how to supplement the existing programs to solve these problems through literature 
comparison, puts forward the program of improving welfare benefits, and brings views on 
the existing problems and how to further improve the living standards of grass-roots doctors. 
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Introduction

On July 12, 2022, the National Health Commis-
sion of China issued the Notice on Several Require-
ments for the Implementation of the Party’s Health 
and Health Work Policy in the New Era focusing 
on the grassroots in the Health System. The circular 
stressed the need to increase investment and improve 
the welfare of grassroots medical workers. To further 
implement the policy, the Health and Health Com-
mission has taken into consideration the promotion 
of the welfare benefits of grassroots medical workers 
from multiple perspectives in terms of specific mea-
sures. From doing a good job of grassroots investiga-
tions to the establishment of a special welfare policy 
to doing a good job of supervision and evaluation and 
a series of processes, we have put forward detailed 
measures. Among them, it is proposed to raise the 
salary level of primary medical workers. In terms of 
graded treatment, it is not difficult to see how much 
attention the state attaches to the quality of work and 
life of grassroots hospitals and workers. However, 
looking back at the present, it is still difficult to solve 
the problems that the workload of grassroots staff is 
higher than the compensation, the status is difficult to 

get attention to, the unemployment rate is high, and 
the talent is easily lost. To improve the lives of medical 
workers, national policies alone are not enough, and 
more needs to be tailored to practical practices and 
joint efforts across multiple themes. Only grassroots 
medical workers can truly stay on the front line of 
grassroots treatment. 

1. Situation Analysis

A striking problem with current research on pri-
mary health care workers and their policies is that 
there is agreement only on salary. In the “Increas-
ing Investment in Grassroots Medical and Health 
Care to Improve the Capacity of Grassroots Medical 
and Health Care Services in Rural Areas” submitted 
by NPC deputies, they pointed out that the salary, 
working environment, and promotion space of med-
ical workers are important reasons for the failure of 
grassroots workers to retain talents. In the “Reply to 
Proposal No. 1409 of the Second Session of the 13th 
National People’s Congress” by the Health Commis-
sion, only the salary of medical workers in service was 
highlighted. Even just mentioned in the “Notice on 
several requirements for the implementation of the 
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Party’s health and health work Policy in the New Era 
with a grassroots focus on the health system”, only 
salary treatment is regarded as the focus and main 
requirement. 

Salary is the basic survival and development of 
primary medical workers. This must be faced to re-
tain them, and this issue must be solved. But is it just 
a salary rise that health workers need? Health care 
relationship, management/hospital policy, work rec-
ognition and recognition, personal growth and de-
velopment, family and work balance, workload, work 
itself, salary, and benefits [1]. Everything I have just 
mentioned plays a vital role in the professional life of 
medical workers. Each of these areas, not just salary, 
needs to be guided by more rational and more benefi-
cial mechanisms for health workers if they are to im-
prove their situation. Because not all problems can be 
solved by raising wages [2], increasing wages cannot 
solve the high-pressure problem. High wages cannot 
solve the issues of most medical disputes in grassroots 
hospitals, and there is a need for more attention to 
grassroots workers. Therefore, for grassroots medical 
workers, just increasing investment and improving 
the salary level of medical workers will still be limited 
in improving the lives of medical workers. 

Even if the salary issue is getting much attention, 
many places must improve. First, look at the current 
salary level of grassroots hospitals: the salary level of 
medical staff in most public hospitals could be high-
er, and most of most are dissatisfied with their salary 
level [3]. This dissatisfaction mainly comes from the 
particularity of the doctor’s profession itself and the 
mismatch between the doctor’s salary and occupa-
tional pressure. The challenges and pressures doctors 
face are enormous. Living under the pressure of life 
every day, emotions are always filled with depression 
and worry. Most doctors would argue that they are 
paid too little for what they do. However, the current 
salary level is still influenced by many factors, such 
as hospital type, job type, educational background, 
establishment, etc., affecting aspects of salary satis-
faction. Although these factors are reasonable, for 
doctors, the intensity and difficulty of most people’s 
work is not related to it, and many people with more 
vigorous work intensity and difficulty have lower 
salaries. The “equal pay for equal work” proposal by 
Song Weijian and others is excellent, and many doc-
tors’ existing factors cannot be why doctors do not 
get better pay. The compensation system needs to be 
made more reasonable to respond to the efforts of 

most of the primary healthcare workers. 
Moreover, compensation is a challenging prob-

lem for most primary hospitals, subject to their 
conditions and the nature of their workers. Policy 
changes make it difficult for grassroots workers to 
raise wages quickly. Therefore, another term for com-
pensation is more practical in this case: welfare treat-
ment. Benefits are more flexible than wages. It will 
improve the form of primary medical workers from 
a single level of compensation to a variety of ways of 
flexible compensation [4]. For example, increasing 
wages to increase paid leave or replacing the salary 
with more perfect, appropriate subsidies that doctors 
need. This change has two benefits: First, for many 
primary hospitals, it is more realistic. Raising the lev-
el of compensation is a kind of pressure on hospitals, 
not to mention paying the equivalent of the actual 
remuneration paid by each doctor. It is an onerous 
requirement for hospitals, and it is difficult for hos-
pitals to implement it. Hospitals can regard welfare 
treatment as long-term financial compensation [5], 
which first reduces the pressure on hospital finances. 

Moreover, flexible compensation is more condu-
cive to institutional implementation. For grassroots 
workers, each benefit is more important than more 
welfare treatment. It is more difficult to establish a 
mechanism system than a large hospital. Moreover, 
even primary hospitals, which are the same size as 
hospitals, are also public and private. Scholars have 
investigated the policies proposed by the central 
government; public hospitals tend to be better im-
plemented than private hospitals. Even if it is strong 
enough to implement policies, it is unnecessary to 
mention the self-conscious policy of improving wel-
fare treatment [6]. Therefore, in this case, the lower 
the execution pressure, the better the degree of im-
plementation. Second, this variety of compensation 
changes also helps to better meet the doctors’ needs 
in more aspects [7]. Establish better welfare models 
for doctors, such as transparency and openness in 
the medical diagnosis process, which can effectively 
reduce the probability of medical disputes in the hos-
pital in the event of accidents. 

Regarding personnel system arrangements, med-
ical workers can reduce stress and arrange more rest 
time by reasonably arranging holidays and person-
nel arrangements. Regarding internal management 
mechanisms, better management means a better 
working environment for medical workers. Therefore, 
flexible compensation changes are meant to meet the 
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needs of medical workers in more ways. Therefore, 
we should consider improving the specific situation 
of medical workers. 

2. The dilemma of welfare treatment 

Improving welfare benefits is a measure that can 
be better implemented to meet various needs. How-
ever, due to the complexity of welfare treatment and 
the uncertainty of its implementation, improving 
welfare treatment in primary hospitals is still faced 
with many difficulties. 

(1) The complexity of welfare benefits itself 
The welfare package itself includes many things. 

It not only includes the increase in salary level but 
also includes holiday planning, humanization adjust-
ment at work, holiday gifts, etcetera, which belong 
to the category of welfare treatment. This sounds di-
verse and allows managers to adjust flexibly. Howev-
er, this is only the classification of measures, and the 
actual layout and planning need to be flexibly adjust-
ed by each hospital according to the actual situation 
[8]. For example, for medical workers who live in a 
high-pressure environment every day, if the compa-
ny can replace the role of other benefits by providing 
holiday gifts during the holidays, then this kind of 
welfare itself does not play a substantial role in help-
ing medical workers. 

Similarly, for doctors living in poor conditions 
without a salary, simply giving them holidays or lei-
sure work will not substantially help. Moreover, some 
types just mentioned are only allowed in sufficient 
conditions. If the staff of a hospital department is 
small, then the duty schedule is difficult to be reason-
able, and there is no way to give appropriate holidays. 
If there is a gap in the amount and difficulty of tasks 
between some departments and other departments, 
it is not appropriate to increase their salary level 
without cause. Therefore, hospital managers need to 
consider how to arrange practical benefits carefully. 
The arrangement needs to be realistic and prevent 
unexpected situations; otherwise, it will spend a lot 
of effort to do useless things. Not to mention, benefits 
are a more flexible way for hospitals to compensate 
medical workers than salaries. More flexibility means 
not only more flexibility but also more consideration 
and countermeasures. Managers must respond to the 
needs of each person in a misplaced manner without 
affecting the operation of the entire hospital. For wel-

fare benefits, the setting itself is a difficult and com-
plex topic, and most managers are often unwilling to 
spend such efforts, which also makes most of the wel-
fare benefits eventually become a muddling through. 

(2) Uncertainty in the implementation of benefits 
In implementing the uncertainty of welfare treat-

ment, there are various problems with whether the 
welfare treatment system can be implemented. As 
mentioned above, the implementation effect of pri-
vate hospitals is not so good because welfare treat-
ment is not a mandatory measure, and even in na-
tional policies, the improvement of welfare treatment 
tends to be more as a means of stimulating the intro-
duction and preventing the loss of personnel. For pri-
vate hospitals, improving welfare treatment requires 
consciousness, which determines that not all hospi-
tals can implement and do an excellent job in welfare 
treatment. 

Different hospitals respond differently to a social 
policy. It is rare to actively respond to reform policies 
and make subjective initiatives to effectively change 
the quality of life of medical workers in a natural way. 
However, it is more superficial, formalistic, and er-
rand feedback for most hospitals. Most of this policy 
is difficult to monitor, as an example of whether doc-
tors know about education. For this policy, it is sim-
ple to test its implementation, if it goes directly into 
the group of doctors, to detect whether their service 
consciousness has changed and improved. However, 
in the implementation of welfare treatment policies, 
the requirement object is fundamentally different. If 
the policy of organizing education learning requires 
doctors, the doctor’s reality can reflect some prob-
lems even if the hospital handles errands. However, 
for welfare policy, the fundamental requirement is 
the hospital itself. This situation is not suitable for 
doctors. Even if it is checked, the hospital will be 
ready one day in advance. To avoid direct conflict 
with the hospital, even if the hospital puts forward 
the corresponding requirements, there will be no ex-
cessive resistance. Most doctors still acquiesced in the 
hospital’s behavior and performed with the hospital. 
This is because workers’ awareness of rights protec-
tion cannot compete with actual power. In this case, it 
is difficult for us to make accurate tests on the actual 
situation of doctors. 

If we decide on the actual situation of doctors, it 
may affect the improvement of the actual situation of 
medical workers in the future, make unrealistic pol-
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icies, make unrealistic claims, and so on. Once such 
problems arise, they will hinder the improvement of 
doctors’ actual situation. 
In addition, in the implementation, this uncertainty 
still exists in the actual effect and conditions. For a 
policy, there may be many changes and adjustments 
in a period, during which period many primary hos-
pitals do not have the cost and conditions to continue 
to try and fail. This will lead to greater stress in the 
transformation of hospitals, greater competition with 
other hospitals, and greater pressure on retaining tal-
ent and staff. 
To sum up, whether it is the concept of welfare ben-
efits itself or the difficulties in the implementation of 
welfare benefits, there are still some difficulties in the 
improvement of welfare benefits for medical staff. 

3. Solution 

(1) Go deep into practical problems 
First, the dilemma of the welfare state should be 

understood; because of the complexity of the prob-
lems it encounters, the reasons for the obstacles it 
encounters are also complex. Therefore, when an-
alyzing such problems, we must adhere to specific 
problem-specific analysis [9]. There must be different 
solutions to different problems. For policies support-
ed by health care workers, find reasons to support 
them and vice versa. Insist on everything from the 
perspective of medical workers, everything back to 
the medical workers. At the same time, the selection 
of actual cases and pilots should start from small to 
large, and it is best to start with grassroots hospitals at 
the county level [10], where the demands of medical 
workers can best represent the most basic demands 
and most demands of all medical workers for welfare 
benefits. Moreover, grassroots hospitals generally 
play a more core role in county-level cities, and we 
can also think about improving the status of grass-
roots medical workers by analyzing the cases of coun-
ty-level grassroots hospitals. 

We can do both to seek truth from facts and go 
deep into the problem. On the one hand, from the top 
down, we need the management to have such a sense 
of responsibility and action to go to the grassroots to 
understand the actual situation of grassroots doctors. 
On the other hand, we also need to come from the 
bottom up. Doctors need to have enough effective 
feedback channels and public power comparable to 
that of management personnel in hospitals, and they 

also need to have a sense of rights protection. In any 
case, for the welfare of grassroots medical workers, 
both sides need to raise awareness and strengthen 
the relevant awareness education. More importantly, 
promoting this awareness needs the incentive of suc-
cessful cases. Only when successful cases appear can 
it play the role of deterring managers and motivating 
grassroots workers. 

(2) Policy refinement 
For the complexity of welfare benefits themselves, 

the best way is to make an acceptable policy to min-
imize their impact. For complex and difficult-to-un-
derstand problems, detailed and rigorous welfare 
policies and mechanisms can be better solved. Here, 
we can think of the so-called more refined policy as 
a kind of rule, which, according to Giddens, is essen-
tially man’s domination of matter, and here, man is 
not merely a manager. A good, refined rule should 
be the control of substances proposed by managers 
and medical workers. This rule affects the resources, 
that is, the so-called domination of one group of peo-
ple over another, that is, the so-called personalized 
arrangement of welfare benefits for everyone. If ev-
eryone completes this policy, acceptance will improve 
when they get the corresponding welfare treatment. 
The refinement of this policy not only comes from 
the needs of everyone but also is an adaptive measure 
of grassroots hospitals to national policies. 

This refinement includes not only the new sys-
tem but also the improvement of the old system. It 
includes not only the design of the system by those 
who make it but also the investigation of the actual 
situation by those who implement it. Because most 
systems can only represent general generalizations, 
managers must be able to apply policies to improve 
actual conditions accurately. This requires managers 
to improve their service capabilities and continuously 
invest more management talents. 

(3) Establish supervision and feedback mechanisms. 
The supervision and feedback mechanism are 

the best guarantee for the implementation of policies. 
What is needed for such supervision and feedback is 
not necessarily the power of the government but the 
power of rules. In Bourdieu’s view, rules as a legit-
imation mechanism can guarantee power. And this 
invisible symbolic power is often more powerful than 
the explicit power. Supervision can serve as a poten-
tial internal discipline and directly make the welfare 
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improvement process more transparent and obvious. 
However, more than mere supervision is needed to 
guarantee the implementation of the policy, and it 
also needs to get effective feedback. The problem’s 
solution requires timely detection and correction 
of the problem, as well as continuous follow-up im-
provement and optimization. To achieve both, it 
is important to establish corresponding feedback 
mechanisms in the future. 

For this monitoring feedback mechanism to op-
erate normally, it has two characteristics: long-term 
preservation and transparency. For this mechanism, 
long-term preservation mainly plays a retrospective 
role. For every doctor, a case that can be stored for a 
long time can help them provide clear information 
when policies change when they need to defend their 
rights, and when they need reference cases. For the 
government and administrators, each clear and defi-
nite case is valuable information for improvement, 
which can provide a basis for further reform and 
promotion of medical policies in the future. There-
fore, to achieve these two objectives, the durability of 
such a mechanism requires some substantive practic-
es. First, the records need to be detailed and precise, 
including the design of the benefits of each doctor’s 
plan, the comparison with the policy provisions at 
the time, and the actual realization of the situation 
to prepare for later information. Second, the doctor 
must determine or fill in the information related to 
the doctor’s actual condition to avoid the emergence 
of false information, avoid this mechanism, and pres-
ent a “false prosperity” state. 

Transparency is relatively more important, and 
what is mentioned in long-term preservation is filled 
in by the doctor himself, which needs to be achieved 
according to this nature. Transparency and openness 
are essential to all oversight mechanisms. Long-term 
preservation also depends on the existence of this na-
ture, and the significance of this transparency is not 
only for doctors but for the whole society; it needs this 
role of transparency and openness. The significance 
of supervision is not only reflected in the protection 
of the parties’ interests but also the imperceptible im-
provement of the external prestige of this policy. 

(4) Incentive and improvement 
So far, most national policies have proposed im-

proving welfare benefits in two ways: attracting med-
ical talent or retaining displaced workers. However, 
we also need to respond to the hard work of health-
care workers. However, what they need is not im-

provement but motivation. Although many medical 
workers stick to their posts, they need more enthu-
siasm [11]. The welfare treatment itself has both the 
incentive and the benefit of the people [12], and its 
role is not only to attract and retain talents but also to 
improve the enthusiasm and stimulate the work en-
thusiasm of primary medical workers. 

The lessons of history have taught us the impor-
tance of motivation. The Soviet Union adopted a sys-
tem of surplus grain collection, which led to a sharp 
decline in food production except for soldiers. They 
have in common that farmers and medical workers 
at that time considered their duty and lacked the at-
tention they should pay. Whether they provided food 
for soldiers at that time or saved lives today, we can-
not deny their irreplaceable obligation. However, the 
consequences of the surplus grain collection system 
will not be resolved many years after the war’s end. 
The same is true for working doctors. Perhaps on-
the-job doctors are diligent in their jobs, and even if 
the benefits offered are not changed or affected, once 
a consensus on the benefits of doctors is not too high, 
it will have a greater impact on the retention of med-
ical talents and prevent the loss of doctors. Therefore, 
whether it is to preserve the current doctor or attract 
future talents, it is the only way to provide better ben-
efits for the current on-the-job doctor. 

4. Summary 

The improvement of welfare benefits plays a 
multi-level role in improving the actual work and life 
quality of medical workers. Compared with the sim-
ple discussion of salary, talking about welfare benefits 
gives them more flexibility and practicality and has 
relatively low hospital requirements. However, due to 
the complexity of the current problems of improving 
welfare benefits, more time may be needed for a par-
ticular discussion. However, for primary health care 
workers, the beginning of this change can always start 
to better tangible improvements in their lives. 
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